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Did you know that European royalty once used cheetahs to hunt deer, or that caracals can capture birds by
leaping six and a half feet straight up into the air from a standing start? Have you ever wondered whether
domestic cats really do land on their feet when they fall, or how Canada lynx can stalk their prey in the
winter without falling through the deep snow?

Wild Cats of the World is a treasure trove of answers to questions like these, and many others, for anyone
who's interested in learning more about the world's felids, including the ones with whom we share our
homes. Mel and Fiona Sunquist have spent more than a decade gathering information about cats from every
available source, many of them quite difficult to find, including scientific papers, descriptions of hunts,
archeological findings, observations by naturalists and travelers, reports from government agencies, and
newsletters from a wide variety of organizations. Weaving information from these sources together with their
own experiences observing wild cats around the world, the Sunquists have created the most comprehensive
reference on felids available. Each of their accounts of the 36 species of cat contains a description of the cat,
including human interactions with it, as well as detailed data on its distribution, ecology and behavior, status
in the wild, and efforts to conserve it. Numerous photographs, including more than 40 in full color, illustrate
these accounts.

Ranging from the two-pound black-footed cat to the five-hundred-pound tiger, and from the African serval
with its satellite-dish ears to the web-footed fishing cat of Asia, Wild Cats of the World will fascinate and
educate felid fans of any stripe (or spot).
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From reader reviews:

Mary Oropeza:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to try and do! A lot of people spent their leisure time with their family, or
their particular friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic in the park. They actually doing same thing every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something
different to fill your own personal free time/ holiday? Could be reading a book could be option to fill your
cost-free time/ holiday. The first thing you ask may be what kinds of publication that you should read. If you
want to try out look for book, may be the book untitled Wild Cats of the World can be very good book to
read. May be it might be best activity to you.

Shelia Lopez:

Playing with family in the park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with friends is thing that usually
you could have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. One activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
have been ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Wild Cats of the World, you could enjoy
both. It is excellent combination right, you still desire to miss it? What kind of hang-out type is it? Oh can
occur its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't buy it, oh come on its called reading friends.

John Harris:

That publication can make you to feel relax. This specific book Wild Cats of the World was colourful and of
course has pictures on there. As we know that book Wild Cats of the World has many kinds or variety. Start
from kids until adolescents. For example Naruto or Investigation company Conan you can read and think you
are the character on there. So , not at all of book tend to be make you bored, any it offers you feel happy, fun
and chill out. Try to choose the best book for you personally and try to like reading that.

Opal Moffett:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got scholars? We believe that that query was
given by teacher with their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. So you know that
little person like reading or as studying become their hobby. You must know that reading is very important
along with book as to be the point. Book is important thing to add you knowledge, except your own personal
teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning something by book. Many kinds of books that
can you go onto be your object. One of them are these claims Wild Cats of the World.
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