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Google Android dominates the mobile market, and by targeting Android, your apps can run on most of the
phones and tablets in the world. This new fourth edition of the #1 book for learning Android covers all
modern Android versions from Android 4.1 through Android 5.0. Freshly added material covers new
Android features such as Fragments and Google Play Services. Android is a platform you can't afford not to
learn, and this book gets you started.

Android is a software toolkit for mobile phones and tablets, created by Google. It's inside more than a billion
devices, making Android the number one platform for application developers. Your own app could be
running on all those devices!

Getting started developing with Android is easy. You don't even need access to an Android phone, just a
computer where you can install the Android SDK and the emulator that comes with it. Within minutes,
Hello, Android gets you creating your first working application: Android's version of "Hello, World." From
there, you'll build up a more substantial example: an Ultimate Tic-Tac-Toe game. By gradually adding
features to the game, you'll learn about many aspects of Android programming, such as creating animated
user interfaces, playing music and sound effects, building location-based services (including GPS and cell-
tower triangulation), and accessing web services. You'll also learn how to publish your applications to the
Google Play Store.

This fourth edition of the bestselling Android classic has been revised for Android 4.1-4.3 (Jelly Bean), 4.4
(KitKat), and Android 5.0 (Lollipop). Topics have been streamlined and simplified based on reader
feedback, and every page and example has been reviewed and updated for compatibility with the latest
versions of Android.

If you'd rather be coding than reading about coding, this book is for you.
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From reader reviews:

David Sayre:

The book Hello, Android: Introducing Google's Mobile Development Platform can give more knowledge
and information about everything you want. So why must we leave a good thing like a book Hello, Android:
Introducing Google's Mobile Development Platform? Wide variety you have a different opinion about book.
But one aim this book can give many data for us. It is absolutely proper. Right now, try to closer with your
book. Knowledge or information that you take for that, you can give for each other; it is possible to share all
of these. Book Hello, Android: Introducing Google's Mobile Development Platform has simple shape but
you know: it has great and big function for you. You can look the enormous world by available and read a
publication. So it is very wonderful.

David Carter:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be upgrade about what going on or data even
knowledge to make all of them keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you
maybe will probably update themselves by examining books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the
problems coming to you actually is you don't know what one you should start with. This Hello, Android:
Introducing Google's Mobile Development Platform is our recommendation to help you keep up with the
world. Why, because this book serves what you want and need in this era.

Carmen Bell:

Would you one of the book lovers? If yes, do you ever feeling doubt while you are in the book store? Try
and pick one book that you just dont know the inside because don't judge book by its handle may doesn't
work at this point is difficult job because you are frightened that the inside maybe not while fantastic as in
the outside appear likes. Maybe you answer may be Hello, Android: Introducing Google's Mobile
Development Platform why because the excellent cover that make you consider with regards to the content
will not disappoint a person. The inside or content will be fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your
reading 6th sense will directly guide you to pick up this book.

Harry Barnes:

Many people spending their period by playing outside using friends, fun activity along with family or just
watching TV 24 hours a day. You can have new activity to enjoy your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,
you think reading a book can definitely hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It fine you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Hello, Android: Introducing
Google's Mobile Development Platform which is keeping the e-book version. So , try out this book? Let's
see.
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