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Plan, implement, and manage VMware’s radically simple, enterprise-class software-defined storage platform

VMware’s Virtual SAN has rapidly proven itself in environments ranging from hospitals to oil rigs to e-
commerce platforms. Along the way, it has matured to offer unsurpassed features for data integrity,
availability, and space efficiency. Virtual SAN 6.x makes all-flash storage practical for even more use cases,
while radically simplifying IT operations and supporting the transition to hyper-converged infrastructures
(HCI). Now, the authors of Essential Virtual SAN (VSAN) have thoroughly updated their definitive guide
to this transformative technology. Writing for vSphere administrators, architects, and consultants, Cormac
Hogan and Duncan Epping explain what Virtual SAN is, how it has evolved, what it now offers, and how to
gain maximum value from it.
 
Hogan and Epping draw on unsurpassed experience shaping Virtual SAN and helping VMware customers
deploy it. They offer expert insight into preparation, installation, configuration, policies, provisioning,
clusters, and more. You’ll also find practical guidance for using its new Health and Performance Services to
gain end-to-end visibility into infrastructure and resource consumption. Both an up-to-the-minute reference
and hands-on tutorial, Essential Virtual SAN, Second Edition uses realistic examples to demonstrate the
immense power of Virtual SAN 6.x. You’ll learn all you need to successfully plan and deploy the newest
versions, and operate them smoothly and efficiently.
 
COVERAGE INCLUDES:

Understanding the goals and concepts of Software-Defined Storage and Virtual SAN●

Meeting updated requirements for safe Virtual SAN 6.x implementation●

Architecting, installing, and configuring Virtual SAN for your unique environment●

Simplifying deployment with VM storage policies and provisioning●

Controlling availability, performance, and reliability●

Efficiently managing and maintaining Virtual SAN●

Providing resiliency and scale-out storage functionality●

Designing and sizing clusters (with examples)●

Using stretched clusters to address rigorous downtime requirements●

Applying valuable new features such as deduplication, compression, checksums, and encryption●

Using Health and Performance Services to troubleshoot hardware, configurations, and performance●
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From reader reviews:

Robert Brown:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone with
everywhere. The information can be a understanding or any news even a problem. What people must be
consider while those information which is inside former life are difficult to be find than now could be taking
seriously which one is acceptable to believe or which one the resource are convinced. If you obtain the
unstable resource then you buy it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All
those possibilities will not happen inside you if you take Essential Virtual SAN (VSAN): Administrator's
Guide to VMware Virtual SAN (2nd Edition) (VMware Press Technology) as the daily resource information.

Paul Jones:

The e-book untitled Essential Virtual SAN (VSAN): Administrator's Guide to VMware Virtual SAN (2nd
Edition) (VMware Press Technology) is the guide that recommended to you to read. You can see the quality
of the book content that will be shown to anyone. The language that creator use to explained their way of
doing something is easily to understand. The copy writer was did a lot of study when write the book, hence
the information that they share for you is absolutely accurate. You also will get the e-book of Essential
Virtual SAN (VSAN): Administrator's Guide to VMware Virtual SAN (2nd Edition) (VMware Press
Technology) from the publisher to make you a lot more enjoy free time.

Jason Scott:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Essential Virtual SAN (VSAN):
Administrator's Guide to VMware Virtual SAN (2nd Edition) (VMware Press Technology) book written by
well-known writer who really knows well how to make book which might be understand by anyone who
have read the book. Written throughout good manner for you, leaking every ideas and publishing skill only
for eliminate your own personal hunger then you still hesitation Essential Virtual SAN (VSAN):
Administrator's Guide to VMware Virtual SAN (2nd Edition) (VMware Press Technology) as good book not
merely by the cover but also with the content. This is one book that can break don't judge book by its deal
with, so do you still needing another sixth sense to pick this!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already
said so why you have to listening to another sixth sense.

Chuck Bryson:

A lot of publication has printed but it differs. You can get it by net on social media. You can choose the very
best book for you, science, comic, novel, or whatever by searching from it. It is referred to as of book
Essential Virtual SAN (VSAN): Administrator's Guide to VMware Virtual SAN (2nd Edition) (VMware
Press Technology). Contain your knowledge by it. Without making the printed book, it could add your
knowledge and make you actually happier to read. It is most critical that, you must aware about publication.
It can bring you from one place to other place.
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