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Fun and Deceptively Simple – succinct yet moving poetry for youngsters

Praise for Shoreline Haiku!

“Thought provoking and beautiful. This is a great book for kids and adults alike.” – Colm

“… simply takes you to a beautiful place!” – Lawrence Lee

“… very peaceful and calming; an ideal short bedtime story that can be enjoyed by all.” – Kevin Matthews

Do your kids love the beach? Would you like help to quiet them down at bedtime? Shoreline Haiku! is a
beautifully illustrated story of a day at the seashore told through a collection of haiku paired with gentle
watercolors.

Your child will delight in the enchanting illustrations and thought provoking verses of Shoreline Haiku!.
Young imaginations will be set alight by the subtle interplay between poetry and painting.

What’s a Haiku? It’s a very short poem: a three line observation about a fleeting moment involving nature.

Haiku are contemplative or wistful in tone and are written with impressionistic brevity. There are no
superfluous words and lines don’t have to rhyme. Imagery and perception take precedence. The meaning of a
haiku is often suggestive, even subjective— inviting reader participation.

The verses in Shoreline Haiku! are composed in a three line format of seventeen syllables in a five-seven-
five pattern that closely approximates the classical Japanese form.

This children’s book is relatable for precocious kids from preschool through ages 6-8.
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From reader reviews:

James Bardsley:

Do you have favorite book? In case you have, what is your favorite's book? E-book is very important thing
for us to find out everything in the world. Each publication has different aim or even goal; it means that
reserve has different type. Some people sense enjoy to spend their the perfect time to read a book. They can
be reading whatever they get because their hobby is usually reading a book. What about the person who don't
like reading through a book? Sometime, person feel need book whenever they found difficult problem or
exercise. Well, probably you will want this Shoreline Haiku!: an enchantingly illustrated children's story told
through short, impressionistic poetry (Early Reader Book).

Billy Gallardo:

This Shoreline Haiku!: an enchantingly illustrated children's story told through short, impressionistic poetry
(Early Reader Book) is great book for you because the content that is full of information for you who have
always deal with world and get to make decision every minute. That book reveal it data accurately using
great plan word or we can claim no rambling sentences within it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you
can have whole info in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight forward sentences but difficult core
information with wonderful delivering sentences. Having Shoreline Haiku!: an enchantingly illustrated
children's story told through short, impressionistic poetry (Early Reader Book) in your hand like keeping the
world in your arm, data in it is not ridiculous a single. We can say that no reserve that offer you world with
ten or fifteen small right but this reserve already do that. So , this really is good reading book. Hey there Mr.
and Mrs. occupied do you still doubt that?

Daryl Church:

You will get this Shoreline Haiku!: an enchantingly illustrated children's story told through short,
impressionistic poetry (Early Reader Book) by look at the bookstore or Mall. Simply viewing or reviewing it
might to be your solve difficulty if you get difficulties to your knowledge. Kinds of this book are various.
Not only by means of written or printed but can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era like now,
you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own
personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose correct ways for you.

Wanda Sousa:

What is your hobby? Have you heard this question when you got students? We believe that that question was
given by teacher to their students. Many kinds of hobby, Everybody has different hobby. Therefore you
know that little person including reading or as looking at become their hobby. You need to know that reading
is very important and also book as to be the thing. Book is important thing to increase you knowledge, except
your own personal teacher or lecturer. You find good news or update concerning something by book. A



substantial number of sorts of books that can you choose to adopt be your object. One of them is this
Shoreline Haiku!: an enchantingly illustrated children's story told through short, impressionistic poetry
(Early Reader Book).
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