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Consulting has become a multimillion-dollar industry in North America. - Understand why people will pay
you for your opinion - Learn from the author of 15 bestsellers - Convert your knowledge into income - A
bestseller through nine editions and 24 printings during the past 25 years! As society becomes more
complicated, people in business, healthcare, education, government, and other fields are calling on specialists
to provide answers to complex problems. This practical step-by-step success guide shows how anyone can
turn knowledge and experience into a profitable consulting business. Concerns unique to the consulting
industry are covered in detail, including: - Assessing yourself and your skills - Determining market
opportunities - Regulations and laws affecting the consulting business - Selecting business and professional
advisers - Preparing your business plan - Setting fees and billing clients - Keeping records - Minimizing
taxes - Avoiding professional liability and preventing losses - Writing a successful proposal - Maintaining
healthy client relations - Running your office smoothly - Hiring sub-consultants
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From reader reviews:

Timothy Patrick:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their down time with their family, or all their
friends. Usually they performing activity like watching television, about to beach, or picnic in the park. They
actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different to fill your own
personal free time/ holiday? Could possibly be reading a book may be option to fill your free time/ holiday.
The first thing you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the book untitled Start & Run a Consulting Business (Start & Run Business Series) can be
good book to read. May be it is usually best activity to you.

Brandon Li:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your day to upgrading your mind expertise or
thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book in comparison with
can satisfy your short space of time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find e-book that
need more time to be examine. Start & Run a Consulting Business (Start & Run Business Series) can be your
answer because it can be read by a person who have those short free time problems.

Helen Williams:

You may get this Start & Run a Consulting Business (Start & Run Business Series) by go to the bookstore or
Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it may to be your solve trouble if you get difficulties for your knowledge.
Kinds of this publication are various. Not only through written or printed but in addition can you enjoy this
book through e-book. In the modern era similar to now, you just looking because of your mobile phone and
searching what their problem. Right now, choose your own ways to get more information about your book. It
is most important to arrange you to ultimately make your knowledge are still change. Let's try to choose
proper ways for you.

Joseph Cosgrove:

As a student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library or to make
summary for some book, they are complained. Just small students that has reading's heart and soul or real
their interest. They just do what the educator want, like asked to go to the library. They go to generally there
but nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring and also can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this era, many ways to get whatever we want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country.
Therefore , this Start & Run a Consulting Business (Start & Run Business Series) can make you experience
more interested to read.
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