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"Nuclear Bunkers" tells the previously undisclosed story of the secret defense structures built by the West
during the Cold War years.

The book describes in fascinating detail a vast umbrella of radar stations that spanned the North American
continent and the north Atlantic from the Aleutian Islands through Canada to the North Yorkshire moors, all
centered upon an enormous secret control center buried hundreds of feet below Cheyenne Mountain in
Colorado. This is complemented in the United Kingdom with a chain of secret radars codenamed 'Rotor'
built in the early 1950's, and eight huge, inland sector control centers, built over 100' underground at
enormous cost.

The book reveals the various bunkers built for the U.S Administration, including the Raven Rock alternate
war headquarters (the Pentagon's wartime hideout), the Greenbrier bunker for the Senate and House of
Representatives, and the Mount Weather central government headquarters amongst others. Developments in
Canada, including the Ottawa 'Diefenbunker' and the regional government bunkers are also studied.

In the UK, there were the London bunkers and the Regional War rooms built in the 1950's to protect against
the Soviet threat, and their replacement in 1958 by much more hardened, underground Regional Seats of
Government in the provinces, and the unique Central Government War Headquarters at Corsham.

Also included in the UK coverage is the UK Warning and Monitoring Organization with its underground
bunkers and observation posts, as well as the little known bunkers built by the various local authorities and
by the public utilities.

Finally the book examines the provision, (or more accurately, lack of provision), of shelter space for the
general population, comparing the situation in the USA and the UK with some other European countries and
with the Soviet Union.
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From reader reviews:

Frank Hall:

With other case, little folks like to read book Cold War Secret Nuclear Bunkers. You can choose the best
book if you like reading a book. Given that we know about how is important some sort of book Cold War
Secret Nuclear Bunkers. You can add know-how and of course you can around the world by a book.
Absolutely right, due to the fact from book you can know everything! From your country until eventually
foreign or abroad you will be known. About simple factor until wonderful thing you could know that. In this
era, we can open a book or perhaps searching by internet device. It is called e-book. You should use it when
you feel fed up to go to the library. Let's go through.

George Harvey:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The guide lovers usually prefer to pick book like comic,
quick story and the biggest you are novel. Now, why not hoping Cold War Secret Nuclear Bunkers that give
your enjoyment preference will be satisfied simply by reading this book. Reading practice all over the world
can be said as the way for people to know world considerably better then how they react in the direction of
the world. It can't be stated constantly that reading practice only for the geeky particular person but for all of
you who wants to end up being success person. So , for all you who want to start reading through as your
good habit, you may pick Cold War Secret Nuclear Bunkers become your own starter.

Philip Raber:

Do you one of the book lovers? If so, do you ever feeling doubt if you find yourself in the book store?
Attempt to pick one book that you find out the inside because don't judge book by its deal with may doesn't
work this is difficult job because you are afraid that the inside maybe not seeing that fantastic as in the
outside seem likes. Maybe you answer may be Cold War Secret Nuclear Bunkers why because the amazing
cover that make you consider about the content will not disappoint an individual. The inside or content is
actually fantastic as the outside or maybe cover. Your reading sixth sense will directly show you to pick up
this book.

William Hayes:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or even 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
expertise or thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book when
compared with can satisfy your limited time to read it because this all time you only find reserve that need
more time to be study. Cold War Secret Nuclear Bunkers can be your answer mainly because it can be read
by a person who have those short time problems.
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