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A Kirkus Reviews Best Nonfiction Book of the Year

When Duncan Wall visited his first nouveau cirque as a college student in Paris, everything about it—the
monochromatic costumes, the acrobats singing Simon and Garfunkel, the juggler reciting Proust—hooked
him. Soon he was attending circuses two or three nights a week, and soon after that, he entered the
intensively competitive training program at France’s École Nationale des Arts du Cirque. The Ordinary
Acrobat is a magical, funny, sometimes scary story of what happens when one average American joins a host
of gifted—and flexible—international students in a rigorous regimen of tumbling, trapeze, juggling, and
clowning. Brimming with surprises, outsized personalities, and plenty of charm, this personal history of how
the circus evolved into the thrilling experience it is today delivers all the excitement and pleasure of the
circus ring itself.
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From reader reviews:

Mary Ayala:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone in
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a concern. What people must be
consider if those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now is taking seriously
which one works to believe or which one often the resource are convinced. If you get the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you. All those possibilities will
not happen with you if you take The Ordinary Acrobat: A Journey Into the Wondrous World of Circus, Past
and Present as your daily resource information.

Bert Gomes:

The Ordinary Acrobat: A Journey Into the Wondrous World of Circus, Past and Present can be one of your
beginner books that are good idea. Many of us recommend that straight away because this guide has good
vocabulary that can increase your knowledge in vocab, easy to understand, bit entertaining but nevertheless
delivering the information. The writer giving his/her effort to place every word into satisfaction arrangement
in writing The Ordinary Acrobat: A Journey Into the Wondrous World of Circus, Past and Present although
doesn't forget the main place, giving the reader the hottest and also based confirm resource information that
maybe you can be one of it. This great information can easily drawn you into brand-new stage of crucial
considering.

John Barrow:

As we know that book is significant thing to add our information for everything. By a publication we can
know everything we wish. A book is a range of written, printed, illustrated or blank sheet. Every year was
exactly added. This reserve The Ordinary Acrobat: A Journey Into the Wondrous World of Circus, Past and
Present was filled regarding science. Spend your time to add your knowledge about your scientific research
competence. Some people has distinct feel when they reading a new book. If you know how big advantage of
a book, you can feel enjoy to read a book. In the modern era like now, many ways to get book that you
simply wanted.

William Rockwood:

Guide is one of source of understanding. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also
native or citizen will need book to know the change information of year to year. As we know those textbooks
have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. With
the book The Ordinary Acrobat: A Journey Into the Wondrous World of Circus, Past and Present we can
consider more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To be creative person must like to read a book.
Just choose the best book that suited with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life by this
book The Ordinary Acrobat: A Journey Into the Wondrous World of Circus, Past and Present. You can more



appealing than now.
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