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Hector Berlioz (1803–69), considered the father of modern orchestration, possessed an intuitive musical
genius. A brilliant colorist and master of the unexpected rhythmic break, he brought a new symphonic
richness to Romantic music. Berlioz was both damned and venerated by his contemporaries: Mendelsson
considered him devoid of talent, and Paganini declared him the one true heir to the spirit of Beethoven. The
composer seems to have sought in music a way to soothe and give voice to the psychological instabilities and
contradictions that more than once brought him to despair. He pioneered the development of what has come
to be called "program music" — i.e., instrumental music with an extramusical significance. He strove to
communicate musically the experiences, psychological themes, scenic descriptions, and literary allusions
more commonly associated with the confessional writings of Romantic poets.
This newest addition to Dover's critically praised music score series presents two of the greatest of these
program pieces, Symphonie Fantastique and Harold in Italy. Here are the full scores of both major
symphonic works — painstakingly reproduced from the authoritative Breitkopf & Hartel edition, available
for the first time in one convenient volume — plus Berlioz's "program" for the Symphonie Fantastique.
Musicians and music lovers everywhere will value this high-quality inexpensive edition, ideal for study and
performance.
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From reader reviews:

Steven Page:

Now a day those who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each information they get. How many
people to be smart in having any information nowadays? Of course the correct answer is reading a book.
Studying a book can help persons out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Symphonie
Fantastique, Op. 14 (Episode in the Life of an Artist) (Dover Miniature Music Scores) book because book
offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the info in this book hundred per cent guarantees there is no
doubt in it as you know.

Mike Jones:

This Symphonie Fantastique, Op. 14 (Episode in the Life of an Artist) (Dover Miniature Music Scores) is
new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information mainly because it relief your hunger of
knowledge. Getting deeper you on it getting knowledge more you know or you who still having little digest
in reading this Symphonie Fantastique, Op. 14 (Episode in the Life of an Artist) (Dover Miniature Music
Scores) can be the light food in your case because the information inside this kind of book is easy to get
simply by anyone. These books acquire itself in the form which can be reachable by anyone, that's why I
mean in the e-book form. People who think that in publication form make them feel tired even dizzy this e-
book is the answer. So there is absolutely no in reading a book especially this one. You can find actually
looking for. It should be here for anyone. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book type for your better
life and knowledge.

Tim Andrus:

As we know that book is important thing to add our expertise for everything. By a e-book we can know
everything we really wish for. A book is a pair of written, printed, illustrated or perhaps blank sheet. Every
year ended up being exactly added. This guide Symphonie Fantastique, Op. 14 (Episode in the Life of an
Artist) (Dover Miniature Music Scores) was filled with regards to science. Spend your spare time to add your
knowledge about your science competence. Some people has several feel when they reading some sort of
book. If you know how big selling point of a book, you can really feel enjoy to read a publication. In the
modern era like now, many ways to get book that you wanted.

Mark Whitten:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from that. You can take knowledge and information
from a book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source which filled update of news. On this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From media social just like
newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, book and comic. You can add
your understanding by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just
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