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The remarkable Battle of Britain experiences of Spitfire pilot Brian Lane, DFC. Brian Lane was only 23
when he when he wrote his dramatic account of life as a Spitfire pilot during the Battle of Britain in the
summer of 1940. Lane was an 'ace' with six enemy 'kills' to his credit and was awarded the DFC for bravery
in combat. The text is honest and vibrant, and has the immediacy of a book written close the event,
untouched, therefore, by the doubts and debates of later years. Here we can read, exactly what it was like to
'scramble', to shoot down Messerschmitts, Heinkels, Dorniers and Stukas and how it felt to lose comrades
every day. Squadron Leader Brian Lane DFC was not only an exceptional fighter pilot but likewise a gifted
leader, at all levels. In what was still a hierarchical and class conscious culture, 'Chiefy' Lane was different:
he knew everyone under his command by first names, no matter how lowly their rank or status, and in the air
he was always unflappable, calmly making the right tactical decision and in the process earning unlimited
respect amongst pilots and aircrew. All these years later the survivors still speak of him with an unparalleled
affection and respect bordering upon a holy reverence. High drama has never before been so
characteristically understated, written, as it was, by the 'Finest of the Few'.
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From reader reviews:

Madeline Wayt:

With other case, little individuals like to read book Spitfire!: The Experiences of a Battle of Britain Fighter
Pilot. You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. As long as we know about how is
important some sort of book Spitfire!: The Experiences of a Battle of Britain Fighter Pilot. You can add
know-how and of course you can around the world by the book. Absolutely right, since from book you can
learn everything! From your country right up until foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple thing
until wonderful thing you may know that. In this era, you can open a book or searching by internet device. It
is called e-book. You need to use it when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's learn.

Kiley Kaufman:

Spent a free the perfect time to be fun activity to perform! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their
family, or their own friends. Usually they undertaking activity like watching television, planning to beach, or
picnic inside park. They actually doing ditto every week. Do you feel it? Do you want to something different
to fill your free time/ holiday? Might be reading a book is usually option to fill your no cost time/ holiday.
The first thing you ask may be what kinds of guide that you should read. If you want to attempt look for
book, may be the publication untitled Spitfire!: The Experiences of a Battle of Britain Fighter Pilot can be
fine book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

Donna Kerns:

A lot of people always spent their free time to vacation or even go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, or maybe
playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity here is look different you can read
a new book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book that you just read you can spent all day every
day to reading a publication. The book Spitfire!: The Experiences of a Battle of Britain Fighter Pilot it is
very good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These folks were enjoying
reading this book. In case you did not have enough space to bring this book you can buy often the e-book.
You can m0ore simply to read this book through your smart phone. The price is not too costly but this book
offers high quality.

Frances McKay:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you could
have it in e-book means, more simple and reachable. That Spitfire!: The Experiences of a Battle of Britain
Fighter Pilot can give you a lot of buddies because by you checking out this one book you have point that
they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. That book can be one of one step for you to get
success. This publication offer you information that might be your friend doesn't know, by knowing more
than other make you to be great folks. So , why hesitate? Let's have Spitfire!: The Experiences of a Battle of



Britain Fighter Pilot.
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