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Kepler's essay, On the Six-Cornered Snowflake, provides the first published evidence of the ideas of regular
arrangements and close-packing which have proved fundamental to crystallography. In it, Kepler ponders on
the problem of why snowflakes are hexagonal, two centuries before the first successful steps were taken
towards its solution.

The purpose of this volume is to display the historical, literary, scientific, and philosophical treasures of
Kepler's essay. The book includes the modernized text of the 1611 Latin edition, with an English translation
by Colin Hardie on the opposite pages. The text is accompanied by an introduction giving details of the
history of the work, and two essays; Professor B. J. Mason's discussion of the scientific meaning and validity
of Kepler's arguments and their relation to the history of crystallography and of space filling, and L. L.
Whyte's examination of Kepler's facultas formatrix in relation to the history of philosophical and scientific
ideas on the genesis of forms.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Davy:

The book The Six-Cornered Snowflake (Oxford Classic Texts in the Physical Sciences) make one feel enjoy
for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to become your best
friend when you getting strain or having big problem with your subject. If you can make reading a book The
Six-Cornered Snowflake (Oxford Classic Texts in the Physical Sciences) to get your habit, you can get far
more advantages, like add your own personal capable, increase your knowledge about several or all subjects.
You could know everything if you like open and read a e-book The Six-Cornered Snowflake (Oxford Classic
Texts in the Physical Sciences). Kinds of book are a lot of. It means that, science e-book or encyclopedia or
others. So , how do you think about this guide?

Rocio Linville:

This The Six-Cornered Snowflake (Oxford Classic Texts in the Physical Sciences) tend to be reliable for you
who want to certainly be a successful person, why. The explanation of this The Six-Cornered Snowflake
(Oxford Classic Texts in the Physical Sciences) can be among the great books you must have is definitely
giving you more than just simple reading through food but feed you with information that probably will
shock your prior knowledge. This book is actually handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever
your conditions in the e-book and printed types. Beside that this The Six-Cornered Snowflake (Oxford
Classic Texts in the Physical Sciences) giving you an enormous of experience including rich vocabulary,
giving you trial of critical thinking that we all know it useful in your day exercise. So , let's have it appreciate
reading.

Michael Kruger:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the sea world or hanging out with pals is thing that usually
you might have done when you have spare time, subsequently why you don't try matter that really opposite
from that. Just one activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you
are ride on and with addition details. Even you love The Six-Cornered Snowflake (Oxford Classic Texts in
the Physical Sciences), it is possible to enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still want to miss it?
What kind of hangout type is it? Oh come on its mind hangout fellas. What? Still don't get it, oh come on its
referred to as reading friends.

Frank Hudson:

E-book is one of source of expertise. We can add our know-how from it. Not only for students but native or
citizen want book to know the upgrade information of year to year. As we know those books have many
advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, also can bring us to around the world. Through the book The
Six-Cornered Snowflake (Oxford Classic Texts in the Physical Sciences) we can get more advantage. Don't
that you be creative people? For being creative person must choose to read a book. Only choose the best



book that appropriate with your aim. Don't end up being doubt to change your life with that book The Six-
Cornered Snowflake (Oxford Classic Texts in the Physical Sciences). You can more attractive than now.
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