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This ground-breaking case study examines record production as ethnographic work. Since its founding in
2003, Seattle-based record label Sublime Frequencies has produced world music recordings that have been
received as radical, sometimes problematic critiques of the practices of sound ethnography. Founded by punk
rocker brothers Alan and Richard Bishop, along with filmmaker Hisham Mayet, the label’s releases
encompass collagist sound travelogues; individual artist compilations; national, regional and genre surveys;
and DVDs—all designed in a distinctive graphic style recalling the DIY aesthetic of punk and indie rock.
Sublime Frequencies’ producers position themselves as heirs to canonical ethnographic labels such as
Folkways, Nonesuch, and Musique du Monde, but their aesthetic and philosophical roots in punk, indie rock,
and experimental music effectively distinguish their work from more conventional ethnographic norms.
Situated at the intersection of ethnomusicology, sound studies, cultural anthropology, and popular music
studies, the essays in this volume explore the issues surrounding the label—including appropriation and
intellectual property—while providing critical commentary and charting the impact of the label through
listener interviews.

Hardcover is un-jacketed.
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From reader reviews:

Latasha Sutterfield:

The particular book Punk Ethnography: Artists & Scholars Listen to Sublime Frequencies (Music/Culture)
has a lot info on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of profit. The book was compiled by the
very famous author. This articles author makes some research just before write this book. This book very
easy to read you can get the point easily after reading this book.

Bobby Hall:

Precisely why? Because this Punk Ethnography: Artists & Scholars Listen to Sublime Frequencies
(Music/Culture) is an unordinary book that the inside of the book waiting for you to snap the idea but latter it
will surprise you with the secret it inside. Reading this book beside it was fantastic author who also write the
book in such amazing way makes the content within easier to understand, entertaining method but still
convey the meaning totally. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this nowadays or you going to
regret it. This excellent book will give you a lot of gains than the other book have such as help improving
your talent and your critical thinking technique. So , still want to hesitate having that book? If I had been you
I will go to the book store hurriedly.

Larry Murray:

This Punk Ethnography: Artists & Scholars Listen to Sublime Frequencies (Music/Culture) is brand new
way for you who has fascination to look for some information as it relief your hunger details. Getting deeper
you upon it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps you who still having small amount of digest in
reading this Punk Ethnography: Artists & Scholars Listen to Sublime Frequencies (Music/Culture) can be the
light food in your case because the information inside this specific book is easy to get by anyone. These
books acquire itself in the form which is reachable by anyone, yeah I mean in the e-book application form.
People who think that in guide form make them feel tired even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So you
cannot find any in reading a reserve especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here
for you. So , don't miss the idea! Just read this e-book style for your better life and knowledge.

Aaron Blue:

With this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple approach to have that. What you need to
do is just spending your time little but quite enough to possess a look at some books. Among the books in the
top record in your reading list will be Punk Ethnography: Artists & Scholars Listen to Sublime Frequencies
(Music/Culture). This book that is certainly qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get you closer in becoming
precious person. By looking right up and review this guide you can get many advantages.
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