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Ryder Axton I always fight hard, fuck harder, and never let myself get personally involved. But my
assignment to apprehend Eduardo Miguel comes to a grinding halt when I find a missing federal witness held
captive in his basement. It becomes fucking personal, fast! Keeping Farrington safe, even if it—or more
likely she—kills me, is now my only mission. But she’s terrified and fights me at every turn. Earning her
trust becomes more than a way to save both our lives, it’s like an addictive drug. I need it—I need her to put
her faith in me—the way I need air to breathe. When she begins investigating the hidden parts of my soul, I
almost can’t deny her. I know I can protect her. I know I could pleasure her in one explosive night she’d
always remember and I’d never forget. What I don’t know is how I could be falling so fucking hard. There’s
no way in hell I can let that happen; getting too close to me comes with an ominous curse that won’t be
defied. I thought I had nothing to lose. I was wrong. Rachel Farrington I should’ve never taken that
dangerous shortcut through the unlit alley to the frat party. It was where I saw a fellow student brutally
murdered and how I made my way onto a cartel leader’s hit list. As a federal witness, I thought I was safe in
the protective custody of the FBI . . . that is until I woke up chained in the monster’s basement. When a
powerful and lethal soldier claiming to be a bounty hunter shows up, I’m not sure if he’s rescuing me or
dragging me towards a greater hell. But after a series of experiences that defy death, the overwhelmingly
sexy, dirty-minded, Navy Seal trained and hot blooded bounty hunter—who obviously plays by his own
rules—just might win my trust. He is not an ordinary man. He’s strong, dark and deadly; his past is
mysterious and his motives unreadable. He seems to be made of the stuff of myth and legend, and of ink and
steel. Is Ryder Axton for real? Or is he employed by my captor for a more sinister purpose? When death
comes, can we defy it… again? Each novel in the Brothers of Ink and Steel series focuses on one couple's
journey to their HEA
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From reader reviews:

Maria Bruns:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in most way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make these people survives, being in the middle of often the crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that sometimes many people have underestimated it for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to endure than other is
high. To suit your needs who want to start reading a new book, we give you this Defy (Brothers of Ink and
Steel) (Volume 3) book as starter and daily reading reserve. Why, because this book is more than just a book.

Paul Birch:

Now a day individuals who Living in the era wherever everything reachable by interact with the internet and
the resources in it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each data they get. How a lot more to be
smart in acquiring any information nowadays? Of course the answer then is reading a book. Looking at a
book can help people out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Defy (Brothers of Ink and Steel)
(Volume 3) book because this book offers you rich data and knowledge. Of course the knowledge in this
book hundred per cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you probably know this.

Duane Sills:

This Defy (Brothers of Ink and Steel) (Volume 3) is great guide for you because the content and that is full
of information for you who else always deal with world and also have to make decision every minute. This
specific book reveal it info accurately using great plan word or we can declare no rambling sentences inside
it. So if you are read this hurriedly you can have whole facts in it. Doesn't mean it only provides straight
forward sentences but tough core information with beautiful delivering sentences. Having Defy (Brothers of
Ink and Steel) (Volume 3) in your hand like keeping the world in your arm, facts in it is not ridiculous 1. We
can say that no publication that offer you world within ten or fifteen moment right but this book already do
that. So , this can be good reading book. Heya Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt which?

Kimberly Towe:

Many people spending their time by playing outside together with friends, fun activity together with family
or just watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to pay your whole day by reading a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book really can hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, taking everywhere you want in your Smartphone. Like Defy (Brothers of Ink and Steel)
(Volume 3) which is having the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's see.
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