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Incorporating seminal and cutting-edge cases and materials, this stellar author team delivers broad coverage
of trademarks, unfair competition, and business torts that includes detailed attention to the role of
technology, along with practice problems that encourage students to think like practitioners.

Ideal for courses on Trademark Law, Unfair Competition, or Business Torts, this casebook features:

a broad examination of current trademark and unfair competition law●

outstanding coverage of false advertising law●

extensive treatment of the "hot news" doctrine (misappropriation), including the most recent cases●

a thoughtful survey of business torts, including cases that address tortious interference, trade libel, and●

related torts such as RICO
dynamic pedagogy that spans cutting-edge cases and materials, notes, questions, and hands-on practice●

problems
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From reader reviews:

Jean Proffitt:

The book Trademarks, Unfair Competition, and Business Torts (Aspen Casebook Series) can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. So just why must we leave a good thing like a book
Trademarks, Unfair Competition, and Business Torts (Aspen Casebook Series)? Wide variety you have a
different opinion about e-book. But one aim in which book can give many facts for us. It is absolutely
suitable. Right now, try to closer using your book. Knowledge or info that you take for that, you could give
for each other; you are able to share all of these. Book Trademarks, Unfair Competition, and Business Torts
(Aspen Casebook Series) has simple shape however, you know: it has great and large function for you. You
can appearance the enormous world by open and read a publication. So it is very wonderful.

Dewey Rascon:

In this 21st hundred years, people become competitive in every way. By being competitive currently, people
have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice simply
by surrounding. One thing that occasionally many people have underestimated the idea for a while is
reading. Yeah, by reading a publication your ability to survive boost then having chance to stay than other is
high. For you personally who want to start reading a new book, we give you that Trademarks, Unfair
Competition, and Business Torts (Aspen Casebook Series) book as beginner and daily reading book. Why,
because this book is usually more than just a book.

Kimberly Duda:

Are you kind of active person, only have 10 or 15 minute in your morning to upgrading your mind talent or
thinking skill also analytical thinking? Then you have problem with the book when compared with can
satisfy your short time to read it because this time you only find guide that need more time to be study.
Trademarks, Unfair Competition, and Business Torts (Aspen Casebook Series) can be your answer as it can
be read by an individual who have those short extra time problems.

Joyce Hynes:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher inquired them to go to the library or
even make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just minor students that has reading's heart and
soul or real their interest. They just do what the instructor want, like asked to go to the library. They go to
there but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring and
can't see colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is to get complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we
know that on this era, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Trademarks, Unfair Competition, and Business Torts (Aspen Casebook Series) can
make you feel more interested to read.
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