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At once familiar and hard to place, the work of acclaimed Canadian cartoonist Seth evokes a world that no
longer exists—and perhaps never existed, except in the panels of long-forgotten comics. Seth’s distinctive
drawing style strikingly recalls a bygone era of cartooning, an apt vehicle for melancholy, gently ironic
narratives that depict the grip of the past on the present. Even when he appears to look to the past, however,
Seth (born Gregory Gallant) is constantly pushing the medium of comics forward with sophisticated work
that often incorporates metafiction, parody, and formal experimentation.

Forging the Past offers a comprehensive account of this work and the complex interventions it makes into
the past. Moving beyond common notions of nostalgia, Daniel Marrone explores the various ways in which
Seth’s comics induce readers to participate in forging histories and memories. Marrone discusses collecting,
Canadian identity, New Yorker cartoons, authenticity, artifice, and ambiguity—all within the context of
comics’ unique structure and texture. Seth’s comics are suffused with longing for the past, but on close
examination this longing is revealed to be deeply ambivalent, ironic, and self-aware.

Marrone undertakes the most thorough, sustained investigation of Seth’s work to date, while advancing a
broader argument about how comics operate as a literary medium. Included as an appendix is a substantial
interview, conducted by the author, in which Seth candidly discusses his work, his peers, and his influences.
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From reader reviews:

Victor Elam:

As people who live in the modest era should be revise about what going on or information even knowledge
to make these individuals keep up with the era which can be always change and advance. Some of you
maybe may update themselves by studying books. It is a good choice to suit your needs but the problems
coming to an individual is you don't know which you should start with. This Forging the Past: Seth and the
Art of Memory (Great Comics Artists Series) is our recommendation to make you keep up with the world.
Why, because book serves what you want and need in this era.

Daniel Starkey:

This book untitled Forging the Past: Seth and the Art of Memory (Great Comics Artists Series) to be one of
several books this best seller in this year, honestly, that is because when you read this guide you can get a lot
of benefit into it. You will easily to buy that book in the book retail store or you can order it by way of
online. The publisher of this book sells the e-book too. It makes you more easily to read this book, as you
can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you personally to past this reserve from your
list.

Bonnie Daves:

Your reading 6th sense will not betray you, why because this Forging the Past: Seth and the Art of Memory
(Great Comics Artists Series) reserve written by well-known writer who really knows well how to make
book which might be understand by anyone who read the book. Written within good manner for you, leaking
every ideas and creating skill only for eliminate your own hunger then you still uncertainty Forging the Past:
Seth and the Art of Memory (Great Comics Artists Series) as good book not just by the cover but also
through the content. This is one e-book that can break don't ascertain book by its deal with, so do you still
needing an additional sixth sense to pick this kind of!? Oh come on your studying sixth sense already told
you so why you have to listening to one more sixth sense.

Thomas Hawkins:

Is it you who having spare time after that spend it whole day by means of watching television programs or
just resting on the bed? Do you need something totally new? This Forging the Past: Seth and the Art of
Memory (Great Comics Artists Series) can be the respond to, oh how comes? It's a book you know. You are
so out of date, spending your time by reading in this completely new era is common not a nerd activity. So
what these textbooks have than the others?
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