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Written 150 years ago, never published, and presumed lost for nearly a century, Wilkie Collins's earliest
novel now appears in print for the first time. Ioláni is a sensational romance--a tale of terror and suspense,
bravery and betrayal, set against the lush backdrop of Tahiti. The book's complicated history is worthy of a
writer famous for intricate plots hinging on long-kept secrets. Collins wrote the book as a young man in the
early 1840s, twenty years before The Moonstone and The Woman in White made his name among Victorian
novelists. He failed to find a publisher for the work, shelved the manuscript for years, and eventually gave it
to an acquaintance. It disappeared into the hands of private collectors and remained there--acquiring mythical
status as a lost novel--from the turn of the century until its sudden appearance on the rare book market in
New York in 1991. This first edition appears with the permission of the new owners, who keep the mystery
alive by remaining anonymous.

The novel is set in Tahiti prior to European contact. It tells the story of the diabolical high priest, Ioláni , and
the heroic young woman, Idüa, who bears his child. Determined to defy the Tahitian custom of killing
firstborn children, Idüa and her friend Aimáta flee with the baby and take refuge among Ioláni's enemies.
The vengeful priest pursues them, setting into motion a plot that features civil war, sorcery, sacrificial rites,
wild madmen, treachery, and love. Collins explores themes that he would return to again and again in his
career: oppression by sinister, patriarchal figures; the bravery of forceful, unorthodox women; the
psychology of the criminal mind; the hypocrisy of moralists; and Victorian ideas of the exotic. As Ira Nadel
shows in his introduction, the novel casts new light on Collins's development as a writer and on the creation
of his later masterpieces. A sample page from the manuscript appears as the frontispiece to this edition. The
publication of Ioláni is a major literary event: a century and half late, Wilkie Collins makes his literary debut.

Originally published in 1999.

The Princeton Legacy Library uses the latest print-on-demand technology to again make available
previously out-of-print books from the distinguished backlist of Princeton University Press. These paperback
editions preserve the original texts of these important books while presenting them in durable paperback
editions. The goal of the Princeton Legacy Library is to vastly increase access to the rich scholarly heritage
found in the thousands of books published by Princeton University Press since its founding in 1905.
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From reader reviews:

Luke Shaffer:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important act, like looking
for your favorite e-book and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your condition; you can add your
knowledge by the guide entitled Iolani; or, Tahiti as It Was. Try to stumble through book Iolani; or, Tahiti as
It Was as your good friend. It means that it can to become your friend when you feel alone and beside
associated with course make you smarter than in the past. Yeah, it is very fortuned for yourself. The book
makes you a lot more confidence because you can know almost everything by the book. So , let me make
new experience and also knowledge with this book.

Yolanda Osuna:

Nowadays reading books become more than want or need but also be a life style. This reading practice give
you lot of advantages. The benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
which improve your knowledge and information. The information you get based on what kind of e-book you
read, if you want drive more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want really feel
happy read one having theme for entertaining like comic or novel. The Iolani; or, Tahiti as It Was is kind of
guide which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Bettye Heinrich:

This book untitled Iolani; or, Tahiti as It Was to be one of several books that best seller in this year, here is
because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit upon it. You will easily to buy that book in the
book store or you can order it through online. The publisher in this book sells the e-book too. It makes you
quicker to read this book, because you can read this book in your Smart phone. So there is no reason to you
personally to past this e-book from your list.

Margo Soares:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With reading you can get a lot of
information that can give you benefit in your life. Using book everyone in this world could share their idea.
Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. Lots of author can inspire their own reader with their story or even
their experience. Not only the story that share in the textbooks. But also they write about the ability about
something that you need instance. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach your children, there are
many kinds of book which exist now. The authors in this world always try to improve their talent in writing,
they also doing some study before they write to the book. One of them is this Iolani; or, Tahiti as It Was.
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